CODE HOME RULE LEGISLATION
October 2007 Session

Bill No. 11-07

County Commissioners of Allegany County, Maryland

A Bill Entitled:

"AN ACT TO REPEAL, AMEND AND RE-ENACT CHAPTER
101 OF THE CODE OF PUBLIC LOCAL LAWS OF
ALLEGANY COUNTY, MARYLAND (1983 EDITION AS
AMENDED), ENTITLED "BUILDING CONSTRUCTION."

SECTION 1.
WHEREAS, the Public Safety Article, Tj e 5, Seetjon 505, of the Annotated
Code of Maryland, requires that localja{i i propriate, adopt and

WHEREAS, Article XI-F, Sectt yland authorizes the

Allegany County Commissiof& ppeal, a pt public local law by
Resolution; and, @
WHEREAS, the Board o ty Co iogers ot Allegany County, Maryland, wish

to repeal the 2004 0de of A ty and adopt current standards to better

serve the needs of theitizens of Allegan! nty.
NOW, THEREFORE, Cha 01efN\he Code of Public Local Law of Allegany County,

r
Maryland, is hereby repeal%ended and re-enacted to read as follows:

SECTION IL
§101-1. Adoption of Building Code

The following Codes and any subsequent amendments, are hereby adopted by
reference as the 2007 Building Code of Allegany County, as if the Codes were set forth in
full in this Section, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, shown
in the Appendix, attached hereto and made a part hereof:

1. The 2006 International Building Code.
2. The 2006 International Residential Code for the governance of one and two
family dwellings and appurtenances.




Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07
Page 2

3. The 2006 International Residential Code , Appendix E, for the governance of
manufactured one and two family dwellings and appurtenances.

4. The National Fire Protection Association Standard #70 - The National Electric
Code.

5. Chapter 166 of the Code of Public Local Law of Allegany County, Maryland,
entitled Plumbing.

6. The International Mechanical Code

7. Chapter 130 of the Code of Public Local Law of Allegany County, Maryland,
entitled Floodplain Management.

8. The Maryland Accessibility Code as set forth in COMAR 05.02.02, and
Chapter 102 of the Code of Public Local Law of Allegany County, Maryland ,
entitled Building Code - Handicapped , whi govern when in conflict.

§101-2. Penalties
Any person violating the Allegany Co ilding Code be subject to the
penalties contained in the Codes a@ by reference hexein,

shall be subject to a
fine in the amount of One Dollar ($ 0 One Thous
that a violation shall continue
§101-3. Severability

tuteas

2 m Rllars ($1,000.00), each day
Q. ense.

Should any provi paragr ragraph of this Act, including any
code or text adopt be decl d void, illegal, unconstitutional, or
otherwise determingd¢fo be une orc a court having jurisdiction, the same shall

not affect the validit egahty, or ablllty of any other provision, section,
paragraph or subparagraph reof, Igpluding any code or text adopted hereby. Each
such provision, section, pa g h or subparagraph is expressly declared to be and is
deemed severable.

§101-4. Existing Liabilities

This Act shall not discharge, impair or release any contract, obligation, duty, liability or
penalty whatever existing on the date of its enactment. All suits and actions, both civil
and criminal, pending or which may hereafter be instituted for causes of action now
existing or offenses already committed against any law or ordinance affected by the
adoption of this Act shall be instituted, proceeded with and prosecuted to final
determination and judgment as if this Act had not become effective.



Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07
Page 3

SECTION III. AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS OF ALLEGANY COUNTY, MARYLAND, that this Act shall
become effective on the 1st day of January, 2008.

PASSED this 8t day of November, 2007.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF ALLEGANY COUNTY, MARYLAND

A@A

m, President

% heson Commissioner
Carol A. Gaffney, V @\
g e R. Lewis, Commissioner

CERTIFICATION

ATTEST: @;2

I, Carol A. Gaffney, Clerk to the County Commissioners of Allegany County, Maryland,
hereby certify that the above action of the Commissioners is a part of the formal, written
record of the public meeting held on the 8t day of November, 2007.

By:

Carol A. Gaffney, Clerk

SEAL

\\documents\laws\bills\building code_2007\CHR Bill #11-07_2007 Building Code_Adopted.doc
ver 11/07 [E4650/IBC2006]



Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07
Page 4

APPENDIX
CHR Bill No. 11-07
October 2007

SECTION I - State Modifications

All additions, insertions, deletions and modifications set forth by The Maryland
Building Performance Standards (MBPS) regulations, as prescribed in COMAR
05.02.07.01 through .09., are hereby adopted by reference.

SECTION II - County Modifications

The following modifications and amendments hav
and pursuant to, the Public Safety Article, §12 Annotated Code of
Maryland. These amendments are in addit ¢ Maryland Building

Performance Standards to conform to lo ui onditions peculiar to Allegany
County, as well as to compliment existi te and ad%twe processes to better

serve its citizens. @
A. County modifications to t igrnation ode:

iohofathe jurisdiction shall have inserted
reference blanks not otherwise
completed a NG the i R penalty dollar amount shall have
inserted the om two-h And fifty dollars ($250.00) to one thousand
dollars ($1,000.80), and ea% e Violation shall continue shall constitute a

separate offense." All referénded\in\phis Code requiring both the issuance of
permits and code enf%zt ith respect to renovation of existing structures are

made under the authority of,

S

the words "Allegan

hereby deleted. All refere related to the International Property Maintenance Code
and its enforcement in this Code are hereby deleted.

Chapter I - Administration

Subsection 101.1 Title:
Amend to read: "These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of
Allegany County, Maryland, hereinafter referred to as “this Code”.

Subsection 101.4 Referenced Codes:

Amend to read: "The other codes listed in §101.4.1 through §101.4.4 and §101.4.6
through §101.4.7 and referenced elsewhere in this code shall be considered part of
the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each such reference. These
other codes may be concurrently covered, superceded or replaced by existing State
and/or local statute, which shall prevail when in conflict. "




Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07
Page 5

Subsection 101.4.5 Property maintenance:
Delete this subsection in its entirety.

Subsection 103.1 Creation of enforcement agency:

Amend to read: "The Division of Land Development Services, for the purpose of
enforcing these regulations, shall be considered the department of building safety
and the Division Chief thereof shall be known as the building official.

Subsection 103.2 Appointment:
Amend to read: "The building official shall be appointed by the Allegany County
Administrator, and shall be a full time employee with all privileges,

responsibilities and controls governing all Civil Sexyice employees of Allegany
County."
Subsection 104.4 Inspections:

In this paragraph, delete the phrase “ ed/ggency” and replace with the
phrase “certified agency”.

Subsection 104.8 Liability:
In this paragraph, first line, d€

the phrase “Building Cq 6@‘\.
Subsection105.2 oﬂ&gm
Delete the first p§
“Exemption: ding pe

to grant autho 10N for any
provisions of thig code, ex

and/or process, or thegxiolati 2
jurisdiction. Building%s shall not be required for the following:”

Delete the first subset “Building:”in its entirety and replace with following;

Building:

1. All government owned buildings or structures.
All agricultural structures (including greenhouse(s) but excepting
Industrialized Feeding Operations).

N>

3. Additions, including decks, porticos and porches.
4. Accessory structures.

5. Tents.

6. Fences.

7. Signs and billboards.

8.

Swimming pools.



Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07
Page 6

9. Antennas, masts, dishes, microwave and cellular towers, WECS and other
similar structures.

10. All repairs,interior modifications, renovations or alterations to existing
buildings or structures.

11. All alterations to equipment, or installation of equipment, that is not
associated with construction requiring a permit.

Subsection 105.3 Application for permit:
Amend first paragraph to read:

To obtain a permit, the applicant shall first file an application therefor in writing,
on a form prescribed by the Division Chief and furrjshed by the Land
Development Sevices office. Such applicatioy 4@ clude, but not be limited to:
Subsection 105.3 Application for a pe \E

Add subset line # 8 to read” State th f A€ contractor(s) associated with the

permitted work, including the vali ylahd professighal or board certifed
license number(s), respectively/

Subsection 105.3.2 Time Ja-m-l.t of applicati
In the third line, replac y82 with ”0
“90” with ”180”

the seventh line, replace

Subsection 105

In the third | ep 180 da o¥fe year”. In the fifth line, replace “180”
with “365”.

Subsection 106) Submltt&qcu ents:

In the third line, repla%the 1’@6(3\) ‘one or more sets” and replace with the phrase

“the number of sets a ribed by the Building Official”; in the fourth line
behind the phrase” shall bevprepared”, add following text, “,signed and sealed”.

Subsection 106.3.1 Approval of construction documents:

In the third and fourth lines, delete the phrase “Reviewed for Code Compliance”
and replace with the following text “Reviewed and Released - Work subject to
Allegany County Building Code and Inspections”. Delete the last sentence of this
paragraph and replace with the following sentence: “The remaining sets shall be
returned to the applicant, and one set shall be kept at the site of work and shall be
open to inspection by the building official or his authorized representative.”

Subsection 106.3.2 Previous approvals:
In the sixth line, delete the number “180” and replace with the text “one year”.

Subsection 109.3 Required inspections:




Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07
Page 7

In the first line behind the phrase “upon notification”, insert the phrase “and at his
discretion”.

Subsection 109.4 Inspection agencies:
In the second line, delete the word “approved” and replace with the word
“certified”.

Subsection 110.2 Required inspections:
In the first line before the phrase “building or structure”, insert the word
“permitted”.

Subsection 110.3 Temporary occupancy:
Delete this section in its entirety and replace w

§110.3 Temporary and conditional o ies,The building official is
authorized to issue a temporary o i certificate of occupancy
red by #he permit, provided
authorized /Stxucture(s) shall be

occupied safely. The buildig ;@ i ime peNod during which
the temporary certificancy is Valid.@
Ge i) @

Subsection 113.2 Notic

Add subsection 1 Ms:

§113.2.1 - Issua ice and cita
Officer shall .‘-’ : e foll \ @ dure for the enforcement of this Code.
§113.2.1.1 Yhe Enforc

ement Qfficer or Building Inspector shall require the
propertyg own \ ate violations of the Building Code by written
notice shall give a 30-day period for compliance. The
Enforcemen{)Officer or Building Inspector shall have the authority
to enter upon and inspect any property when the County has
probable cause to believe that violation(s) of the Building Code are
located thereon.

§113.2.1.2 Any property owner given proper notice who does not comply
within the 30-day period given shall be served with a civil citation
pursuant to authority granted by Article 25B, Section 13(c) of the
Annotated Code of Maryland. The following violations are
deemed to be civil infractions:

§113.2.1.2.1 Class I - Construction without a permit, or work
performed not in compliance with the Permit or the
Building Code, and the owner is notified and does not



Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07

Page 8

abate the violation within thirty (30) days of the written
notice.

§113.2.1.2.2 Class II - Junk, debris or other existing health hazard is
present, or where structural failure is imminent or exists
and endangers public safety and welfare; and the owner
is notified and does not abate the violation within thirty
(30) days of the written notice.

§113.2.1.3 All civil citations shall be processed in accordance with Article 25B,
Section 13(c) of the Annotated Code of Maryland. Each violation
under this chapter is a separate pffense, and a separate citation shall
be issued for each discrete viokas Rach day that a violation
exists is considered a sepa Repeat violations for the
same offense in a twelve 1i0d will result in a doubling of
all applicable fines.

§113.2.1.4 A schedule of fipe

for AN infractiors’shall be established by the
Allegany Coug ] missioners to time by resolution.
. .‘

All such £ ef paid shallbe e property of Allegany

r)dr any’rule or regulation adopted
all §gns as a civil infraction and shall be
) ss’than two-hundred-fifty dollars ($250)

and dollars ($1,000), and court costs, at
discretigtnof tRe cotrt as provided herein. If any violation be
continued, %ﬁi violation shall be deemed a separate offense.
§113.2.1.6 The Codn¥\Qr any citizen may institute injunction, mandamus, or
other appropriate actions, or proceedings at law or equity for the
enforcement of violations or to correct violations; and any court of
competent jurisdiction shall have the right to issue restraining

orders, temporary or permanent injunctions, mandamus, or other
appropriate forms of remedy or relief.

§113.2.1.5

Chapter 2
Definitions

In Section 202, Definitions, add the following term and its definition.

CABIN: A building that does not provide complete, independent living

facilities for one or more persons, that may partially include provisions for



Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07
Page 9

living, sleeping, eating, cooking or sanitation facilites, and is designed and
intended solely for seasonal or intermittent use in the pursuit of recreation
or pleasure.

Chapter 3
Use and Occupancy Classification

In Section 312, Utility and Miscellaneous Group U, include the term “Cabin” in
the project description list provided in §312.1. General.

Appe
Include Appendix B - Board of AppedIsNOy thé greation, maintenance and
administration of appeals board.

@rnational R
wirirfg’the ins @urisdiction shall have inserted
ty, Maryland™ eference blanks not otherwise
the i a pehalty dollar amount shall have
inserted the

?s ' fifty dollars ($250.00) to one thousand
dollars ($1,00000Q), and each da ation shall continue shall constitute a
S i

B. County modifications to the ode

General:

separate offense/ All refer, his Code requiring both the issuance of
permits and code enfofsement\witlY respect to renovation of existing structures are
hereby deleted.

Part I - Administrative
Chapter I - Administration

Subsection R101.1 Title:
Amend to read: "These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of
Allegany County, Maryland, hereinafter referred to as “this Code”".

Subsection R103.1 Creation of enforcement agency:

Amend to read: "The Division of Land Development Services, for the purpose of
enforcing these regulations, shall be considered the department of building safety
and the Division Chief thereof shall be known as the building official.

Subsection R103.2 Appointment:




Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07
Page 10

Amend to read: "The building official shall be appointed by the Allegany County
Administrator, and shall be a full time employee with all privileges,
responsibilities and controls governing all Civil Service employees of Allegany
County."

Subsection R104.4 Inspections:
In this paragraph, forth and sixth lines, delete the phrase “approved agency” and
replace with the phrase “certified agency”.

Subsection R104.8 Liability:
In this paragraph, first line, delete the phrase “board of appeals” and replace with
the phrase “Building Codes Appeals Board”.

Subsection R104.10.1 Areas prone to floodin:
In this paragraph, second line, delete the’térpm”s and replace with the term
“may”. Delete the phrase “board of replace with the phrase

“Building Codes Appeals Board”.

Subsection R105.2 Work exempt Srbm p¥rmit:
Delete the first paragraph ace with the fQ

“Exemptions from Bu drmi i %\i this code shall not be

A Tto KNGe done in any manner in
tion from the requirements
violation of any other laws or
ermits shall not be required for

violation of the
of a Land
ordinances
the followingy

Delete the first subset W&@ ivits entirety and replace with following;

Building:

1. All government owned buildings or structures.

2. All agricultural structures (including greenhouse(s) but excepting
Industrialized Feeding Operations).

3. All residential additions of 600 square feet or less to one or two family
dwelling(s) and appurtenances.

4. All residential accessory structures of 600 square feet or less for properties

containing one or two family dwelling(s).

Tents.

Fences.

All deck additions less than 30” above grade.

Signs.

. Swimming pools.

0. Antennas, masts, dishes and other similar communication devices.

20 0 N oW



Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07
Page 11

11. All ordinary repairs, interior or exterior modifications, renovations or
alterations to building(s), including plumbing, electrical and mechanical
work contained within or on; alterations to indoor and outdoor equipment;
or installation of equipment, that is not associated with construction
requiring a permit.

Subsection R105.3.2 Time limitation of application:
In this paragraph, third line, delete the text “180 days” and replace with the text
“one year”.

Subsection R105.5 Expiration:
In this paragraph, third line, delete the text “1
“one year”. In the seventh line, delete the texf dayys” and replace with the text
“one year”.

Subsection R106.3.1 Approval of cp@ru ocuments:
In this paragraph, fourth line, del&éﬂ%ﬁ( APPROYAD PLANS PER IRC
SECTION 106.3.1” and replacg/frith the

subject to Allegany County Bb a e Code and I

Subsection R109.2 Insmencies: @
- I f O

In this paragraph, elete t
the text “certified

ved agency” and replace with

nd the phrase “ building or structure”,

( this Code,”. Under Exceptions:, delete line #2.
f vi

Subsection R113.2 Notjce of vidlation:
Add subsection R113.2.1. ollows:
§113.2.1 - Issuance of notice and citation. The Building Inspector or

Enforcement Officer shall adhere to the procedure setforth in the 2006
International Building Code (IBC), amended by Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-

07, Appendix, §113.2 — Notice of violation for the enforcement of this Code.

Part I - Definitions
Chapter 2 - Definitions

In Section R202, Definitions, add the following term and its definition.



Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07
Page 12

CABIN: A building that does not provide complete, independent living facilities
for one or more persons, that may partially include provisions for living, sleeping,
eating, cooking or sanitation facilites, and is designed and intended solely for
seasonal or intermittent use in the pursuit of recreation or pleasure.

Part III - Building Planning and Construction
Chapter 3 - Building Planning

Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria:

Delete the table and replace with the followi -@

Wi

Wind Subject To Damage From:(( \/ Ice Shield Air Mean

Roof Seismic Y ter X Flood .

Speed . . ) Barrier Freezin | Annua
Snow d Design | \voathering® Frost line i esign uireq | Hazards |
Load Category' 9 depth® 6’\"“' € Temp® ) ‘h g g

(mph) Index' | Temp

N\
Y Moderate \%5
40 | 90 A Severe @ ) | 0 Heavy (R\ 1988 | 1000 | 50

%Xvendices

Include Appendix E - Man%ed Housing Used As Dwellings for the governance
of installation of manufactured housing on individual lots for single family occupancy.
Where in conflict, the administration of the permitting process will be governed as the
International Residential Code, Part I, with amendments, as set forth previously in this

Bill.

SECTION III - Clarifications

Existing Applications and Permits - All valid permit applications accepted by the Codes
Official, and all valid permits issued through the Codes Official prior to the effective
date of this law, may be governed under the provisions of the code for which they were
submitted or issued. These applications and permits shall remain valid so long as the
subject work conforms to the code in which they were applied or issued. The Code
Official may, at his discretion, grant extensions upon written request, and only after the




Code Home Rule Bill No. 11-07
Page 13

applicant or permittee has demonstrated just cause and that the proposed work
addresses the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public.

Official Texts - The official text of all codes and texts adopted hereby shall be
maintained by the Clerk to The County Commissioners at the office of the County
Commissioners. The Clerk to the County Commissioners may provide certified copies
of all such texts in accordance with applicable copyright law, and subject to a charge
which may be established from time to time.



	CERTIFICATION
	SECTION I – State Modifications
	Chapter I – Administration
	Part I – Administrative
	Part II – Definitions
	Part III – Building Planning and Construction
	Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria:
	Table R301.5 Minimum Uniformly Distributed Live Loads:






